
PTB AWARD FORM 

 
Name of Institution: Department of Education 

Tender Bulletin No Bid Number /  Project Description Bid Amount Points Name of Bidder Contact Person 

 
 
 
 
17 – 21/22FY 
 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributors, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 
 

 
 
  
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
95,00 

 
 
 
 
African paper 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ecdoe
.gov.za 

 
 
 
 
17 – 21/22FY 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributors, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 
 

 
 
  
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
27,57 

 
 
 
Afropulse 46 (PTY) 
LTD 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ec
doe.gov.za 

 
 
 
 
17 – 21/22FY 
 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributors, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 

 
 
  
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
41,89 

 
 
Freedom stationery 
(PTY) LTD 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ec
doe.gov.za 

 
 
 
 
17 – 21/22FY 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributors, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 
 

 
 
  
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
11,61 

 
 
 
Raptoscore (PTY) 
LTD 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ec
doe.gov.za 

 
 
 
 
17 – 21/22FY 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributors, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 
 

 
 
  
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
52,18 

 
 
 
Palm Stationary 
Manufactures 
 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ec
doe.gov.za 
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17 – 21/22FY 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributor, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 
 

 
 
 
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
47,60 

 
 
 
Khumzi Investment 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ec
doe.gov.za 

 
 
 
 
17 – 21/22FY 

 
 
 
 
SCMU6-
2021/2022 

Supply and delivery of scholastic 
stationery to an allocated distributor, 
warehouse for all schools in the 
eastern cape. 
 

 
 
  
 
Rate Based 

 
 
 
 
11,01 

 
 
 
Power Spinks 
Investment 

Mr P Nxozana @ 
040 6084524 
Email : 
Pakamile.nxozana@ec
doe.gov.za 

 


